
5. Information on litigations 
involving PAO Sovcomflot

As a global shipping company, the Company 
operates in various jurisdictions and is involved 
in court/arbitration proceedings relating to cargo 
transportation by sea. The Company’s third-party 
liability is, as a rule, insured with international 
mutual insurance clubs, which assist the 
Company in the settlement of court/arbitration 
disputes.   

In carrying out its activities the Company is 
governed by the requirements of anti-corruption 
laws and the highest corporate and ethical 
standards, the principles of fair and faithful 
conduct of business, and expects compliance 
with such standards from its business partners. 

As part of the policies and procedures applied 
by the Company to counter fraud and corruption 
in any form, during the period between 2005 
and 2007 the Company initiated certain legal 
proceedings. In particular, in late 2005 the Group 
investigated a number of transactions which 
involved the former management of Novoship 
(UK) Ltd. 

Novoship (UK) Ltd and its subsidiaries filed 
claims at the Commercial Court in London in 
December 2006. Judgment was handed down 
on 14 December 2012. The Group was initially 
successful on all claims in the court of first 
instance, but after appeal unsuccessful on some 
claims against certain defendants. In 2014 those 
defendants indicated an intention to pursue the 
Group for damages in respect of $90 million of 
security provided during the litigation. The limit 
for filing claims expired at the end of 2020. 
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